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Exhibitor Index

A



Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7E19 ,
main exhibitors

ADmotive KG

63303 Dreieich, DE

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 5, booth 5B11 ,
co-exhibitors

Aeoon Technologies
GmbH

6233 Kramsach, AT

TecStyle Visions
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Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7E13 ,
main exhibitors

ALDISPLAYS GmbH

51069 Köln, DE

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3D60 ,
main exhibitors

Aleso Lukasz Sum

35-311 Rzeszów, PL

TecStyle Visions

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3A40 ,
main exhibitors

Alexandra Maxa

GiveADays
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1210 Wien, AT

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 5, booth 5B55 ,
main exhibitors

AMANN Group

74357 Bönnigheim, DE

TecStyle Visions

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7B52 ,
main exhibitors

Andreas Harmuth
CNC-Frästechnik

26954 Nordenham, DE

wetec

Show information 

wetec
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Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7C51 ,
main exhibitors

Antalis GmbH

Antalis is part of the Kokusai
Pulp & Paper Group, a leading
global distributor of paper,
packaging and visual
communications based in
Japan. The group achieved a
turnover of 545 billion yen in
2021. ...

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7A51 ,
co-exhibitors

APA S.p.a.

20123 Mailand, IT

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 5, booth 5B14 ,
main exhibitors

ARA nv

We have 50 years of experience
in screen printing and we are

TecStyle Visions



2023/4/4 17:32 wetec - Exhibitor Index | Messe Stuttgart

https://www.messe-stuttgart.de/wetec/en/visitors/exhibitor-index#/ 5/11

specialized in high quality
textile transfer printing for a
wide range of applications on
different types of garments. We
offer solutions f...

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7B11 ,
co-exhibitors; Hall 7, booth
7A51 , co-exhibitors

Arlon Graphics, LLC

2583 CM Den Haag, NL

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 5, booth 5C50 ,
co-exhibitors

Artiplus Pinkappel
GmbH

Artiplus, specialized dealer for
transfer printing, sublimation
printing, transfer presses and
textiles since 1991. In our
extensive range you will find

TecStyle Visions
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everything you need for
individual printing of ...

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7D30 ,
main exhibitors

AS Licht &
Shopmanufaktur
GmbH

92242 Hirschau, DE

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3B33 ,
main exhibitors

ATLANTIS
HEADWEAR - Master
Italia S.p.A.

Atlantis Headwear is an Italian
brand specialized in designing
and manufacturing sustainable
custom headwear, hoping to
generate a growing demand for
products made from

TecStyle Visions
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recycled/organic sources and
tr...

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7E35 ,
main exhibitors

Automatic Letter
Bender Dariusz
Slawomir Wiszenko

15-519 Bialystok, PL

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7A18 ,
main exhibitors

AVD GmbH & Co. KG

79346 Endingen, DE

wetec

Show information 

wetec
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Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7B11 ,
co-exhibitors

Avery Dennison
Materials Group
Europe

58322 Schwelm, DE

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 7, booth 7B40 ,
main exhibitors; Hall 7, booth
7A51 , co-exhibitors

Avery Dennison
Materials Sales
Germany GmbH

58332 Schwelm, DE

wetec

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 5, booth 5B31 ,
co-exhibitors

Avient Material
Solutions UK Ltd

TecStyle Visions



2023/4/4 17:32 wetec - Exhibitor Index | Messe Stuttgart

https://www.messe-stuttgart.de/wetec/en/visitors/exhibitor-index#/ 9/11

B

L34 9GT Knowsley /
Merseyside, GB

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3E11 ,
main exhibitors

AWDis Brands

EH54 5DJ Livingston, GB

TecStyle Visions

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3E74 ,
main exhibitors

AYSOY PAZARLAMA
KONFEKSIYON
Tekstil San. ve Tic.
Ltd. Sti.

20030 Merkezefendi / Denizli,
TR

TecStyle Visions

Show information 
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Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3A57 ,
main exhibitors

badge4u Wojciech
Pawlowski

43-600 Jaworzno, PL

GiveADays

Show information 

Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3B31 ,
co-exhibitors

bags2GO

One brand. Three collections.
Endless possibilities. - BASIC,
SOLID and NEW.BASE. - The
bags from bags2Go stand for
functionality, diversity and
selected features. For sports
lovers, shopping queens...

TecStyle Visions

Show information 

TecStyle Visions
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Exhibitor | Hall 3, booth 3A25 ,
main exhibitors

Bamatex AB

504 64 Borås, SE

Show information 


